
RFQ# 965690 ‐ Provision of Headwall Landscaping Rock 

 

 

 

 

Alley Cassety

Cost Criteria (70 Points) 56

Approach and Delivery (30 Points) 30

Total (100) 86

RFQ# 965690 ‐ Provision of Headwall Landscaping 

Rock

Enter Solicitation Title & Number Below

RFQ # 965690 ‐ Headwall 

Landscape Rock

Incentive 

Percentage

Incentive 

Calculator Lowest Bid MACP

Offeror's Name Bids SBE

Cost Evaluation 

(56 Pt Max)

SBE/SDV 

Evaluation (14 Pt 

Max)

Total Cost 

Points (70 

Pt)

Alley Cassety 342,312.96$              $0 56.00 0.00 56.00
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Troup, Terri (Finance - Procurement)

From: Gossage, Jeff L (Finance - Procurement)
Sent: Friday, February 17, 2017 1:52 PM
To: Troup, Terri (Finance - Procurement)
Subject: RE: Single Offeror Approval Request for RFQ # 965690 - Provision of Headwall 

Landscaping Rock

Award to a single offeror is approved. 
________________________ 
Jeff L. Gossage, C.P.M. 
Purchasing Agent 
Metropolitan Government of Nashville & Davidson County 
615-862-6639 Office 
Jeff.Gossage@Nashville.gov  
 

 
 

From: Troup, Terri (Finance - Procurement)  
Sent: Friday, February 17, 2017 1:11 PM 
To: Gossage, Jeff L (Finance - Procurement) 
Subject: RE: Single Offeror Approval Request for RFQ # 965690 - Provision of Headwall Landscaping Rock 
 
Jeff: 
 
I am following up on this single offeror approval request. 
 
Thanks 
 
Terri R. Troup 
Finance Administrator 
Purchasing and Contract Management 
730 2nd Ave South, 1st Floor 
P.O. Box 196300 
Nashville, TN 37219‐6300 
615/862‐6669 
 
 
 

From: Troup, Terri (Finance - Procurement)  
Sent: Monday, February 13, 2017 2:58 PM 
To: Gossage, Jeff L (Finance - Procurement) 
Subject: Single Offeror Approval Request for RFQ # 965690 - Provision of Headwall Landscaping Rock 
 
There was only one proposal received from Alley Cassety Trucking on RFQ # 965690 ‐ Provision of Headwall Landscaping 
Rock. The evaluation team has reviewed and evaluated the proposal. The evaluation team is okay with 
moving forward with a single offeror.  Attached is the evaluating scoring for this solicitation. Please let me know if you 
approved the award of this single offeror. 
 
Thanks 
Terri R. Troup 
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Finance Administrator 
Purchasing and Contract Management 
730 2nd Ave South, 1st Floor 
P.O. Box 196300 
Nashville, TN 37219‐6300 
615/862‐6669 
 


